S

Volusia County
FLORIDA

ALL PROPOSALS ACCEPTED BY THE COUNTY OF VOLUSIA ARE SUBJECT
TO THE COUNTY’S TERMS AND CONDITIONS. ANY AND ALL
ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY RESPONDENTS
MAY BE REJECTED AND MAY HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT.
SOLICITATION BID DOCUMENTS FROM THE VENDORS LISTED HEREIN
ARE THE ONLY BIDS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF THE CLOSING DATE AND
TIME. ALL OTHER PROPOSALS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO THIS
SOLICITATION, IF ANY, IS HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE.

Recommendation of Award

Bid Number: 22-B-41HO
Bid Title: Pipe Lining and Rehabilitation of Stormwater Structures
Opening Date:  6/29/2022 3:00 p.m.
Atlantic Pipe Services, Inliner Soluti Shenandoah General | Vortex Services, LLC
LLC Hinterland Group, " me{;é: tons, LMR Construction, Inc. | Construction, LLC | 5910 Hartford Street
1420 Martin Luther | Inc 5580 State Road 2531 Jewett L 997 Dawes Road 1888 NW 22nd Street| Tampa, FL 33619
King Jr. Blvd. 524 Cocoa, FL 32926 Sanf. ;erL 3;7";1 Frostproof, FL 33843 | Pompano Beach, FL | Patrick G. LeClair
Sanford, FL 32771 Chase Rogers Danicl Bank Luis Montanez 33069 813-626-0700
Allan Cagle 321-633-7066 43'7“:72 ’:]':] l:“ 863-635-4651 Daniel DiMura NON-
407-792-1360 e 954-975-0098 RESPONSIVE**
RICIPP Point $396,850
Repair, Purchase No Bid No Bid $359,450.00 No Bid
and Install $384,944.50*
RICIPP Lining -
Purchaes & $47.830 $36,043
Install Repair $36,419.00 $41,295.00 $35,440.75
* *
length 0-1000 ft. $46,395.10 $34,961.71
Rehabilitation of] $69.00 $44.00
Concrete $36.00 No Bid No Bid
Masonry $66.93* $42.68*
Stormwater By- $9,250 $5.850
Pum iny $3,800.00 $2,450.00 $400.00
pass tumping $8,972.50* $5,674.50*
Maintenance of $7.850 $7,275
Traffic $24,600.00 $32,700.00 12,900.00
$7,614.50* $7,056.75

*Local Preference Applied
Heidi Ott, Purchasing Analyst II & Meghan Chestnut, Purchasing Analyst II
Heidi Ott, Purchasing Analyst II
Recommendation of Award (ROA):

Opened by:
Tabulated by:

LMR is lowest responsive and responsible bidder including Point Repair Services

Inliner Solutions — lowest responsive and responsible bidder for all services excluding Point Repair Services.

* Vortex Services deemed non-responsive due to failure to provide pricing for Stormwater By-pass Pumping.

County Council: September 20, 2022

Approved by:

Pamele Wilskey

Pam Wilsky, NIGP-CPP, CEPB, CPPO
Director of Purchasing and Contracts
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