
UNIT Goodson Paving Prefered Materials, Inc V.A. Paving

SP-9.5 ROAD PAVING
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                121.50  $                            157.95  $       113.22 

SP-9.5 PARKING LOT
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                138.00  $                            216.05  $       139.17 

SP-9.5 BIKE PATH
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                165.00  $                            263.10  $       215.00 

SP-12.5 ROAD PAVING
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                124.75  $                            152.10  $       109.45 

SP-12.5 PARKING LOT
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                140.00  $                            210.15  $       135.17 

SP-12.5 BIKE PATH
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                165.00  $                            259.75  $       215.00 

SPEED HUMPS SP-9.5
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 715.00  $                            1,200.00  $       650.00 

< 25 TN PATCHING SP-9.5 
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 550.00  $                            1,446.00  $       605.00 

25-50 TN PATCHING SP 9.5
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 425.00  $                               920.25  $       385.00 

HOT ASPHALT SP-9.5 FOB TON NO BID  $                               102.05  $          87.00 

HOT ASPHALT SP-12.5 FOB TON NO BID  $                               102.05  $          83.00 

DESCRIPTION

Contractor                                              ASPHALTIC 
CONCRETE               BID # B-6-23-70                      

BID TABULATION

SUPERPAVE

Bid Title:  Paving Services & Asphaltic Concrete
Bid No:     B-6-23-70
Opening Date & Time: August 17, 2023 10:00 AM
Posting Date: August 22, 2023        Through:  August 29, 2023 @ 5:00 PM                  Posted By: James Norris



FC-5 ROAD PAVING
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 210.00  $                               300.35  $       244.40 

FC-9.5 ROAD PAVING
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                161.00  $                            192.90  $       137.22 

FC-12.5 ROAD PAVING 
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                159.00  $                            174.15  $       134.87 

< 25 TN PATCHING FC-12.5
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 615.00  $                            1,445.00  $       635.00 

25-50 TN PATCHING FC-12.5
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED TON  $                 565.00  $                               917.00  $       415.00 

HOT ASPHALT FC-12.5 FOB TON NO BID  $                               124.00  $       110.00 

SY 0 - 2,500 SY SY  $                      7.90  $                                   6.55  $            5.00 

SY 2,501 - 5,000 SY SY  $                      3.60  $                                   4.45  $            3.00 

SY 5,001 - 15,000 SY SY  $                      2.70  $                                   3.10  $            2.75 

SY 15,001 + SY SY  $                      2.45  $                                   3.10  $            2.50 

ARAMID FIBER PER ATTACHED 
SPECIFICATIONS TON  $                    20.00  $                                 19.20  $          10.00 

TACK FOB GAL  $                    10.25  $                                 23.50  $          15.00 

PRIME
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED SY  $                      0.85  $                                   2.00  $            1.00 

PRIME AND SAND
VENDOR DELIVERED, 
VENDOR PLACED SY  $                      1.05  $                                   2.00  $            2.00 

ASHPALT MILLINGS FOB TON NO BID  $                               110.00  $          75.00 

 $                    18.00  $                                 16.50  $          10.00 

FRICTION COURSE 

*  The Vendor Delivered, Vendor Placed price per ton must include all associated 
costs. Additional hauling costs will not be allowed.

MISCELLANEOUS

COST FOR MILLING 
& CLEANUP

NON-STANDARD HOURS WORK PER TON



Approval _________SC___________________

Intended Award: All Items will awarded to Goodson Paving, Inc. Preferred Materials, Inc and V.A. 
Paving

Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted to VendorLink at www.myvendorlink.com Brevard
County encourages prompt and fair handling of all complaints and disputes with the business community.
Filing of any disputes and appeals shall be in accordance with procedures specified in bid documents.
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