CITY OF COCOA
TABULATION SHEET

Dyal WTP - Water Treatment Chemicals
ITB B-20-19-COC

ITB Final Tabulation: July 30th, 2020

Note: The Tabulation
document the screen
proposal pricing, mat
immaterial contents.

Sheet is used to
ing of bid /

erial and

Results of the the

tabulation are documented within this
form DOES NOT constitute an award.

After evaluations are

recorded,

recommendation is reviewed by City
Council for final approval. Notice of
award will be sent forth via email from
the Purchasing and Contracts Division.
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Praxair Inc. Liquid Oxygen Only No Bid: Quicklime
$128.02 / ton
. $ 6,400.00 | $ 6,590.00| $ 6,790.00( $ 7,000.00( $ 7,210.00( $ 33,990.00
No Bid: Starch
Lhoist North America of Alabama, LLC Quicklime Only
mg g:g ;gl:lci Oxygen $ 1,969,750.00 | $ 1,969,750.00 | $1,969,750.00  $ 2,068,250.00| $2,171,650.00| $ 10,149,150.00
Carmeuse Americas Quicklime Only
No Bid: Liquid Oxygen
No Bid: Starch $ 1,587,700.00 | $ 1,619,450.00| $ 1,651,850.00| $ -1 $ -1$ 4,859,000.00
Tropichem Enterprises Starch Only
No Bid: Liquid Oxygen $  184,140.00 | $  184,140.00| $ 184,140.00| $ -1 s -8 552,420.00

No Bid: Quicklime
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